



	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q	R	S	T	U	V	W	X	Y	Z	AA	AB		
22	JH HELMETS	HELMETS, JUNIOR HIGH FOOTBALL: Air inflation System for Optimal Fit, Comfort and Safety; White High-Impact ABS Shell, 3-Year Warranty to Include Gray Lightweight Facemask, with Mid-High Hookup Soft Cup Chin Strap; Standard or Inflatable S-Pads; No Rust Stainless Steel Hardware. Riddell Revolution Youth Speed or Approved Equal	All of our JH stock is currently Riddell. The Shutt helmets on item # 68 will give the JH coaches the choice between both brands.	Each	60	\$ 96.00	Riddell Speed Classic Youth #41169 / XL is \$111.00 / include soft cup chin strap, no paint	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 95.00	All sizes/ Schutt 205800 White A11 Youth Helmet w/ Mask	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	94.00	Schutt Vengeance A11 w-carbon-steel mask	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	
23	HS HELMETS	HELMETS: Varsity Football Helmet. Riddell Speed Icon, No Substitute. Indicate price difference if applicable per size.		Each	100	\$ 231.75	Riddell Speed Icon #41197 / XL is \$246.75 / includes hard cup chin strap, no paint	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
24	HS HELMETS	HELMETS: Varsity Football Helmet. Riddell Speed Flex Helmet, No Substitute. Indicate price difference if applicable per size.		Each	12	\$ 315.00	Riddell Speed Flex #41195 / XL is \$330.00 / includes hard cup chin strap, no paint	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
25	JERSEYS, PRACTICE	JERSEYS: Football practice, 100% polyester porthole mesh body & pro mesh sleeves with solid yoke, belt length, hemmed body & sleeves; Colors: White, Black, Royal. Riddell PJME. No substitute.		Each	50	\$ 10.75	Same price for all sizes / No Numbers	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 11.00	for M/L/XL and \$13.00 for 3XL/ Russell S096BM	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
26	JERSEYS, PRACTICE	JERSEYS: Football practice, 100% polyester porthole mesh body & pro mesh sleeves with solid yoke, belt length, hemmed body & sleeves; Colors: White, Black, Royal; Riddell PJP. No substitute.		Each	484	\$ 7.20	Same price for all sizes / No Numbers	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 11.00	for M/L/XL and \$13.00 for 3XL/ Russell S096BM	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
27	JERSEYS, GAME REPLACEMENTS	JERSEYS, JUNIOR HIGH REPLACEMENTS: Polyester Porthole Mesh Body and Sleeves, Double-Ply Polyester Knit Yoke, Hemmed Body and Sleeve Ends, Belt Length; Rawlings Vapor Compression or equal		Each	100	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 48.00	Rawlings VFCJDE	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
28	JERSEYS, GAME REPLACEMENTS	JERSEYS, JUNIOR HIGH REPLACEMENTS FOR "C" TEAM: Porthole Mesh Body and Sleeves Double-Ply Polyester Knit Yoke, Hemmed Body and Sleeve Ends, Belt Length; Front: Screen Print 8 inch Numbers; Back: 10 inch Numbers; Colors: Black Jerseys and White Jerseys with Contrasting Numbers. Riddell PJP or Approved Equal.		Each	50	\$ 11.20	Same price for all sizes / includes 1 CL #s front & back	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 16.95	for M/L/XL and \$18.95 for 3XL/ Russell S096BM	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
29	KNEE PADS	Riddell Part #48134 or approved equal.		Each	200	\$ 5.75	Per Pair / Riddell KLA/KMA. #48134 has been discontinued	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 4.65	Schutt 13401402	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 2.55	Adams USA #KLF-1 / Lowest bid, but quality of pads are not best value.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
30	LACES	LACES: Shoe, 45" length. White/Black.		Gross	4	\$ 12.96	Riddell 1502BK	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 33.85	Athletic Specialties LSP	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
31	LACES, SHOULDER PADS	LACES, SHOULDER PAD: 40 inch Braid Round Nylon, Black.		Gross	4	\$ 12.96	Riddell 1501BK	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 29.25	Athletic Specialties SPB	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 25.24	40" Black / BSN Sports #FBSPL36B	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
32	LANYARDS	LANYARDS: 100% nylon with clamp and swivel, 12 per pack		Pack	6	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 12.00	Martin L1	\$ 3.60	Champion #126-Color. Visit www.championsports.com to view all champion items.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 2.79	sold as pack of 12 / Sporttime 121xxx / see bid for #s and colors	\$ 2.88	Sold in dozen only BSN Sports #MSLNYD (pick your color)	\$ 4.00	Adams USA #670-BK	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid		
33	LINEMAN SPLIT MARKERS	LINEMAN SPLIT MARKERS: Adjustable, Heavy Duty Vinyl Construction with Weights at the Ends and Center to Keep it Flat on the Ground; Labeled Removable Positions, Overall Length: 39 Feet; 10.5 inches Wide Black Strip with 36 inches Long Yellow Position Indicators Labeled with 9 inch High Letters. Pro Down or Approved Equal.		Each	2	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 94.55	Fisher LUM	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 94.00	Pro Down 200234007	\$ -	no	\$ 275.00	6" wide x 37" long, 30" player space/ Rogers O/D Scrimmage Line #410343	\$ 240.00	Gilman Guideback #STOCK1		
34	MOUThPIECES	MOUThPIECES. Must meet NCAA, National High School Federation and ASTM standards. Colored with loop end for attaching to the helmet; Colors: Red, Black, Yellow Gold, Royal; Custom fitted. Riddell #45791 or Buyer approved equivalent.		Each	2000	\$ 0.37		\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 49.95	Adams MG301	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 0.31	sold in packs of 25 only. BSN Sports #MSMOUT	\$ 0.40	Adams USA #MG-301-CC / sold in boxes of 100. \$40 per box/ strapped or strapless. Multiple colors/meets all standards	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
35	MOX BOX, COMPLETE KIT	MOX BOX HELMET ACCESSORY KIT: Revolution Speed Icon helmet hardware complete kit. Riddell R27590. No substitution		Each	4	\$ 190.00	Speed Accessory Kit (not mox box)	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
36	HS PADS, SHOULDER	SHOULDER PADS: Quarterback/Running Back, 1 Douglas 25M, 1 Douglas 25S. No Substitution.		Pair	6	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 406.50	PSQK	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 275.00	Pro Gear Standard PL / Bid is lower, but not the specified brand requested.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
37	HS PADS, SHOULDER	SHOULDER PADS, LINEBACKER: Douglas Mr. DZ, Large No Substitution.		Pair	4	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 406.50	PSDZ	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 275.00	Pro Gear Standard PL / Bid is lower, but not the specified brand requested.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
38	PADS, SHOULDER	SHOULDER PADS: Air Management Liner System. Flat Pad. Removable Back Plate. Adjustable Y-Belt. Integrated Channels. Corrugated Arches. Riddell Phenom SK or Buyer approved Equivalent.		Each	24	\$ 98.00	Riddell 48325	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 160.00	Schutt XV-HD 8013	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
39	PADS, SHOULDER	SHOULDER PADS: Air Management Liner System. Flat Pad. Removable Back Plate. Adjustable Y-Belt. Integrated Channels. Corrugated Arches. Riddell Phenom AP or Buyer approved Equivalent.		Each	24	\$ 98.00	Riddell 48326	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 160.00	Schutt HV-HD All Purpose 801357	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
40	PADS, SHOULDER	SHOULDER PADS: BIOTHANE Cap. Flat Pad Designs. Air Management Liner. Velvet Collar. Corrugated Arches. Sewn-in Channels. Stainless Steele Hardware Kombine LN or Buyer Approved equal		Each	24	\$ 128.00	Riddell 48312	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 495.00	X-Tech #ASB-Combo	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
41	PADS, SHOULDER JUNIOR HIGH	SHOULDER PADS, JUNIOR HIGH: Removable Body for Easy Cleaning, Closed-Cell Padding in the Body for Added Protection, Over Open-Cell Padding for Extra Comfort; 3 inch Extra Wide Cantilever Strap Placed at a 9-degree Angle, Covered Rivets, Coated Webbing on the Cantilever, Epaulet Straps, Plastic Back Straps, Pre-Drilled for Neck Roll. Riddell Rival JV or Approved Equal.		Each	20	\$ 57.00	Riddell 48321	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 75.00	Schutt Mid Flex #802357	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 87.50	Schutt #T-Flex AP	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid

	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q	R	S	T	U	V	W	X	Y	Z	AA	AB	
50	42	PADS, KNEE	PADS - Knee, Biolite Vent Air Knee Pads - Pair Pack, Small 3.5", Riddell #R48159 or buyer approved equal.		Pair	200	\$ 3.20	Riddell 48159	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 5.75	Schutt #13402302	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 2.17	3" Round knee pads / Gear Protec #1388428 - Bid is lower, but size of pads are smaller. Please review.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
51	43	PANTS, GAME	GAME PANTS, REPLACEMENT - DOBIE/CORBETT: Color: RED/ROYAL/BLACK/WHITE. Rawlings High Performance Game Pant, or equal	Matching jersey will be coming from Cardinal's. We need to purchase the set together.	Each	100	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 37.50	All sizes/ Rawlings #FP147	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ <del>21.57</del>	<del>Rawlings #RWP147</del>	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
52	44	PANTS, PRACTICE	PANTS, PRACTICE: Football Heavy Duty with Combined Tunnel and Slotted, 2-1/2 inch Elastic Waistband, Flatlock Stitch, 3-Piece Back, 14 Slots/Pockets for Pads; 92% Polyester/ 8% Spandex Slotted, Color: White; Reinforced Knee. Rawlings TITANIUM, F4590 or Approved Equal	We have had customer service difficulties with America Team Sports in the past and prefer not to use them.	Each	80	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 12.00	All sizes/ All-Star #FBP1A	\$ -	No Bid	\$ <del>9.95</del>	All sizes / Champro #FP12	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
53	45	PANTS, PRACTICE	ROCKET PANTS: Polyester Practice Pant. White		Each	80	\$ 7.75	Same price all sizes / Riddell PPPC	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 9.95	All sizes / Champro #FP12	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
54	46	PANTS, PRACTICE JUNIOR HIGH	PANTS, HIGH SCHOOL VARSITY PRACTICE: Football, 100% Polyester Double Knit (36 Cloth), Slotted Waist, Double Duke Gusset with Lace Fly. Color: White. Rawlings, Don Alleson, or Approved Equal.	We have had customer service difficulties with America Team Sports in the past and prefer not to use them.	Each	80	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 12.00	All sizes/ All-Star #FBP1A	\$ -	No Bid	\$ <del>9.95</del>	All sizes / Champro #FP12	\$ -	No bid	\$ 11.66	All sizes / Alleson #AA6105SL	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
55	47	PANTS, GAME, JUNIOR HIGH	CHAMPRO Blocker Poly Spandex Football Game Pants 92%polyester/8%Spandex high luster fabric with "quick recovery" elasticity Slotted waist, Five panel construction with "no Lace" duke crotch Youth FP20Y; Adult FP20	Matching jersey will be coming from Cardinal's. We need to purchase the set together.	Each	100	\$22.25 / \$24.25	Youth / Adult - Riddell Champro FP20	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 20.50	YM-YL/ \$23.50 Adult SM-XL/ \$26.50 2X/ Champro #FP20Y (youth)/ #FP20 (adult)	\$ <del>14.95</del>	<del>YM-YL/\$16.79 AS-AXL/\$19.30 2XL / Champro #FP20</del>	\$ 17.25	YM-YL/ \$19.25 All Adult Sizes / Champro #FP20Y (youth)/ #FP20 (adult)	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
56	48	PYLONS	Weighted Anchored Pylons, Gilman Preferred or approved equal.	Gilman is a better quality item and will last longer. We'd rather pay a higher price now for something we won't need to replace as quickly.	Each	12	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 83.75	Fisher PY1 (sold in sets of 4)	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 25.79	Champion Sports #FPYLSET Sporttime brand SSI #021657 sold as a set of 4	\$ <del>17.27</del>	<del>BSN Sports #MSWPYLON set of 4</del>	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 32.00	Weighted Anchorless Pylon/ Rogers Pylons #401323	\$ 444.00	Gilman #WP12
57	49	SHORTS, PRACTICE	SHORTS: Practice Football Shorts. 100% tricort mesh, Multiple needle covered elastic waist band with inside drawstring. Hemmed leg bottom. 9" inseam. Indicate price difference if applicable per size. With 1-color screen print on left leg: Colors: Royal with yellow gold; Black with silver; Riddell WSPT or Buyer approved equivalent.		Each	436	\$ 5.95	Same price all sizes / Riddell Badger C2 Mesh Short 5109	\$ 10.00	sm-xl / \$12 for XXL / A4-03 Mesh Short - 1C / Pricing is if you need 100 pr per school	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 6.75	Badger #5109 / priced at 72+, no numbers.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 6.35	All sizes / A4 #NS283	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
58	50	SINGLE MAN TACKLIN COVER	Replacement cover for a Gilman single man tackling sled		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 205.00	Gilman #RP315. Bod Cover Only. If pad from 2005, may need new pad.
59	51	SLED, 16-ARM	SLED, 16-ARM: Rogers PowerBlast™ or Approved Equal.		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 4,790.00	Rogers 16-Arm #410416	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 3,334.00	Rogers 16-Arm Powerblast #410422	\$ 3,150.00	Gilman #200G5-16; no pads.
60	52	SLED, 20-ARM	SLED, 20-ARM: Rogers PowerBlast™ or Approved Equal.		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 5,159.00	Rogers 18-Arm #410418	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 4,216.00	Rogers 20-Arm Powerblast #410424	\$ 3,150.00	Gilman #200G5-16; 16 arms, no pads. - Bid is the lowest, but is not 20-Arm.
61	53	SNAP STICK	SNAP STICK, FOOTBALL: Aluminum Extension (4 ft. up to 8 ft.) Pole with a Foam Football on the End. Gilman or Approved Equal.		Each	2	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 40.30	Fisher #Stickball	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 26.28	Pro Down #1299939 / 30"-60" Pole Extends	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 105.00	Rogers Quick Snap #410648/ Pole adjusts from 3' to 6'.	\$ 104.00	Gilman #SNAP1
62	54	TEES	TEES: Ground Zero, 1" kick-off tees Ground Zero, No Substitute.		Each	10	\$ 14.50		\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 10.75	Champion GZ1	\$ 8.65	Ground Zero #GZ1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 10.18	FBGZ1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
63	55	TEES	TEES: Ground Zero, 2" kick-off tees Ground Zero, No Substitute.		Each	7	\$ 14.75		\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 11.75	Champion GZ2	\$ 9.90	#GZ2	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 10.18	#1405590	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
64	56	TEES	TEES: Ground Zero, 1" Extra-point tees Ground Zero, No Substitute. -Received No Bids.		Each	7	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
65	57	T-SHIRTS	T-SHIRT, CAP SLEEVE: Medium Weight, 100% Cotton; Athletic Cut, Cap Sleeves; Color: Ash with 1-Color (Black, Royal Blue, Red) Screen Print. Riddell RTSM or Approved Equal.	Not the lowest bid, but is best value. No minimum and includes logo.	Each	760	\$ 4.40	Sm-Xlg / \$5.90 2X / \$6.05 3X / includes 1 CL Logo / Riddell (Gildan) #5000 Cotton Ash T-Shirt	\$ 3.25	sm-xl/ \$5.25 XXL/ \$6.25 XXL if ordering 250+ shirts. Gildan 03-Tshirt-1C	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 6.00	sm-xlg / \$8.00 2X-3X / priced for 48 / Brand: San Mar #PC61	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 5.15	SM-XL/ \$6.15 2XL-3XL / Poa & Co #PC54	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
66	58	WHEEL KIT FOR 20-ARM SLED	Whee kit for 20-arm sled; for use on artificial turf		Kit	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ 618.00	Rogers #410680	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 583.00	Rogers Powerblast Wheel Kit #410680	\$ 760.00	Gilman #W1. Only fits Gilman Gauntlet.
67	59	WHISTLE	WHISTLE: Fox 40 classic, black or approved equal		Each	24	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 4.35	Fox 40 #040	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 3.54	Fox 40 #040 - SSI #1319279 sold as each	\$ 3.46	FOX #MSWHIFOX/ Black	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
68	60	WRIST BANDS	Triple Play Game Plan Wristbands; 3 game plan compartments, 6 1/2" long with 3" x 5" windows; Adidas Football Wrist Coach. No Subs		Each	57	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 12.00	#5142688	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 12.50		\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H	I	J	K	L	M	N	O	P	Q	R	S	T	U	V	W	X	Y	Z	AA	AB
69	61	WRIST BANDS	WRISTBANDS, TRIPLE PLAY GAME PLAN: 3-Game Plan Compartments, Youth Size 4 1/2inch Long with 2 3/4 inch x 3 1/2 inch Windows; Adidas Football Wrist Coach, No Subs.		Each	15	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 12.50		\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
70	62	EZ TRIPOD SYSTEM	<b>END ZONE TRIPOD SYSTEM-Rovercam 26 Elite , No Substitutes -- RECEIVED NO BIDS.</b>		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
71	68	JR HIGH HELMETS	Schutt Vengeance All Youth. No Substitute.		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 95.00	Same price for all sizes / White A11 youth helmet w/ mask #205800	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 97.50	All sizes	\$ -	No bid	\$ 97.00	All sizes / \$113.00 Painted	\$ 94.00		\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
72	69	VARSITY HELMETS	Schutt Vengeance Pro LTD. No Substitute.		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 280.00	Same price for all sizes / Vengeance Pro is going out. Vengeance Z10 LTD.	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 225.00	All sizes	\$ -	No bid	\$ 218.00	All sizes / \$233.00 painted	\$ 230.00		\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid
73	70	VARSITY HELMETS	Schutt F7 VTD Collegiate. No Substitute		Each	1	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 285.00	Schutt #208800	\$ -	No Bid	\$ 295.00	All sizes	\$ -	No bid	\$ 298.00	All sizes / \$313.00 painted	\$ 315.00		\$ -	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid