

**Charter Bus Services, 20-038V
Approved Provider List**

PROCEDURES

1. Contact Transportation to see if a District bus will meet your charter needs (this should always be your first stop). If no,
2. Contact one or more Charter Service companies for a quote. Based upon your travel requirements, vendors may provide listed pricing but may NEVER quote a higher price. * MUST request bus with passenger 3 point seat belts.*
3. Select a contractor based upon quotes and requirements and proceed with processing your request through iTCCS.

Approved Vendors

<p>AJL International 3049 E Highway 71 Del Valle, Texas 78617 Phone: 800 546 6508 Fax: 817 589 7007</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Erley Jackson, VP of Global Email: Erley@AJLInternational.com PH Direct: 469 647 9170 Cell: 817 822 2583 Fax: 817 589 7007</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Complete AJL Quote form & Email to: Erley@ajlinternational.com team-reservations@ajlinternational.com PH: 469 647 9170 / 800 546 6508 Fax: 817 589 7007</p>
<p>Clark Charters & Travel, Inc. 3406 W. 2nd Street Taylor, Texas 76574 Phone: 512-365-1511 Fax: 512-352-7110 Roadrunner Charters - San Antonio 1272 FM 1516, SA, TX 78263</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Tyler Weller, Sr. Acct Manager Email: tyler@clarktravel.net PH: 512-365-1511 Fax: 512-352-7110</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Complete online Quote form: https://www.clarktravel.net/get-a-quote PH: 512-365-1511 Fax: 512-352-7110</p>
<p>Corporate Services International 4402 Nixon Lane Austin, TX 78725 Phone: 713-647-6906 Fax: 713-647-7057 24/7 Central Dispatch PH: 713 647 6906</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Nawar Nick Nofal, President Email: info@csidmc.com PH: 713-647-6906 Cell: 951-795-2643 Fax: 713-647-7057</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Complete CSI Quote form & Email to: info@csidmc.com PH: 512 736 9600 Fax: 512 373 3222</p>

**Charter Bus Services, 20-038V
Approved Provider List**

PROCEDURES

1. Contact Transportation to see if a District bus will meet your charter needs (this should always be your first stop). If no,
2. Contact one or more Charter Service companies for a quote. Based upon your travel requirements, vendors may provide listed pricing but may NEVER quote a higher price. * MUST request bus with passenger 3 point seat belts.*
3. Select a contractor based upon quotes and requirements and proceed with processing your request through iTCCS.

Approved Vendors

<p>Daisy Motor Coaches / Avalon Transp. 1505 E. Houston St. San Antonio, Texas 78202 Phone: 210 225-8600 Fax: 210 225-8617</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: David Bratcher, General Manager Email: david@daisycharters.com PH: 210-225-8600 Cell: 210 896-9656 Fax: 210 225-8617</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Contact: David Bratcher or Karen Bandy Email: david@daisycharters.com or kbandy@daisycharters.com PH: 210 225-8600 Fax: 210-225-8617</p>
<p>Kerrville Bus / Coach USA 1430 E. Houston St. San Antonio, Texas 78204 Phone: 210 226 7371 Fax: 210 299 1237</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Gloria Butler, Charter Manager Email: gloria.butler@coachusa.com Phone: 210 226 7371 x 325 Cell: 210 241 4803 Fax: 210 299 1237</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Contact: Gloria Butler or Maria Perez Email: gloria.butler@coachusa.com or maria.perez@coachusa.com Phone: 210 226 7371 x 325 Toll Free PH: 800 256 2757 Fax: 210 299 1237</p>
<p>OK Tours, LLC 737 Austin St San Antonio, Texas 78215 Phone: 210 222-8880 Fax: 210 222-8280</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Marcos Sarmiento, Chief of PH: 210 222-8880 Cell: 210-240-1464 Fax: 210 222-8280</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Email: service@oktours.com online: www.oktours.com Phone: 210 222-8880 Fax: 210 222-8280</p>
<p>Regent Coach Line LTD 515 Sherman San Antonio, Texas 78202 Phone: 210 212 0510 Fax: 210 212 0512</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Nicole Moreno, Charter Sales Mgr Phone: 210 212 0510 Fax: 210 212 0512 Email: nicole@regentcoachline.com</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Email: charter@regentcoachline.com or nicole@regentcoachline.com PH: 210 212 0510 Fax: 210 212 0512</p>

**Charter Bus Services, 20-038V
Approved Provider List**

PROCEDURES

1. Contact Transportation to see if a District bus will meet your charter needs (this should always be your first stop). If no,
2. Contact one or more Charter Service companies for a quote. Based upon your travel requirements, vendors may provide listed pricing but may NEVER quote a higher price. * MUST request bus with passenger 3 point seat belts.*
3. Select a contractor based upon quotes and requirements and proceed with processing your request through iTCCS.

Approved Vendors

<p>Sam's Limousine and Transportation, 13012 Moore Rd Austin, Texas 78719 Phone: 713-780-7077 Fax: 713-780-7574</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Kathy Scott, Sales & Marketing - Email: kathy.scott@samslimousine.com PH: 512-402-3264 x 201 Cell: 512-940-5800 Fax: 713-780-7574</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Contact: Kathy Scott Email: kathy.scott@samslimousine.com PH: 512-402-3264 x 201 Cell: 512-940-5800 Fax: 713-780-7574</p>
<p>Star Shuttle 1343 Hallmark San Antonio, Texas 78216 Phone: 210 341-6000 Fax: 210 366-1252</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: Melanie Camarillo, Call Ctr Manager Phone: 210 341-6000 x 101 Cell: 210-602-6868 Fax: 210-366-1252</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Email: melanie.camarillo@starshuttle.com confirmations@starshuttle.com PH: 210 341-6000 x 101 Fax: 210 366-1252</p>
<p>Wynne Transportation, LLC 7650 Esters Blvd Irving, TX 75063 Phone: 972-915-7300</p>	<p>Account Rep: Contact: David Dowdle, VP Accounting Phone: 972-915-7300 Email: david.dowdle@gowynne.com</p>	<p>Quotes & Scheduling: Email: salesgroup@gowynne.com info@gowynne.com PH: 972-915-7300</p>

*** NOTE:** As per Texas Transportation Code, Section 547.701(e) as bus contracted for the transportation of schoolchildren shall be equipped with a three point seatbelt for each passenger, including the operator.

**Charter Bus Services, 20-038V
Approved Provider List**

Contract: August 1, 2020 - July 31, 2021, with 4, 1-YR Renewals	AJL International 3049 E Highway 71 Del Valle, TX 78617	Clark Charters & Travel, Inc. 3406 W. 2nd Street Taylor, TX 76574	Corporate Services International (CSI) 4402 Nixon Lane Austin, TX 78725	Daisy Motor Coaches / Avalon Transportation, LLC 1505 E. Houston St. San Antonio, TX 78202	Kerrville Bus /Coach USA 1430 E. Houston St. San Antonio, TX 78204	OK Tours, LLC 737 Austin St. San Antonio, TX 78215	Regent Coach Line 515 Sherman San Antonio, TX 78202	Sam's Limousine and Transportation 13012 Moore Rd Austin, TX 78719	Star Shuttle 1343 Hallmark Dr. San Antonio, TX 78216	Wynne Transportation, LLC 7650 Esters Blvd Irving, TX 75063
--	--	--	--	---	---	---	--	---	---	--

Group A – Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus

1.	Hourly Rate	per Hour	\$140.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$105.00	\$113.00	\$120.00	\$99.22	\$115.00	\$110.00	\$124.00
	Minimum Hours per Trip:	Hours	5	5	5	5	5	7	5	5	5	5
2.	Daily Rate – up to 24 hours	Day	\$1,400.00	\$1,600.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,260.00	\$1,356.00	\$1,800.00	\$1,190.70	\$1,200.00	\$550 - \$2,640	\$1,240.00
3.	Mileage Rate	Per Mile	\$3.50	\$3.85	\$4.00	\$3.85	\$4.15	\$4.20	\$3.54	\$3.50	\$3.95	\$2 - 4.50
Mileage Rate would apply when:			Mileage rate applies to trips that are 200 miles or over one-way but under 10 hours of total usage.	Mileage rate will be used when it surpasses the hourly charge.	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher	When total miles fee exceeds the hourly or daily rate.	Mileage rate applies outside of 100-mile radius	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	Dead head miles are \$2 per mile; live miles are \$4.50 per mile

Group B – Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus

4.	Hourly Rate	per Hour	\$130.00	No Bid	\$120.00	\$105.00	No Bid	\$115.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.00	No Bid
	Minimum Hours per Trip:	Hours	4	No Bid	5	5	No Bid	7	No Bid	No Bid	5	No Bid
5.	Daily Rate – up to 24 hours	per Day	\$1,300.00	No Bid	\$1,440.00	\$1,260.00	No Bid	\$1,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$550 - \$2,640	No Bid
6.	Mileage Rate	per Mile	\$3.25	No Bid	\$4.00	\$3.85	No Bid	\$4.15	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.95	No Bid
Mileage Rate would apply when:			Mileage rate applies to trips that are 200 miles or over one-way but under 10 hours of total usage.	No Bid	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher	No Bid	Mileage rate applies outside of 100-mile radius	No Bid	No Bid	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	No Bid

Group C – Minimum 40 Seat Mini Bus

7.	Hourly Rate	per Hour	\$125.00	\$110.00	\$115.00	\$100.00	No Bid	\$110.00	\$90.00	\$95.00	\$102.00	\$110.00
	Minimum Hours per Trip:	Hours	4	5	5	5	No Bid	7	5	5	5	5
8.	Daily Rate – up to 24 hours	per Day	\$1,250.00	\$1,430.00	\$1,380.00	\$1,200.00	No Bid	\$1,700.00	\$1,080.00	\$1,140.00	\$150 - \$2,448	\$1,100.00
9.	Mileage Rate	per Mile	\$3.15	\$3.60	\$3.75	\$3.75	No Bid	\$4.10	\$3.38	\$3.56	\$3.50	\$2 - 3.50
Mileage Rate would apply when:			Mileage rate applies to trips that are 200 miles or over one-way but under 10 hours of total usage.	Mileage rate will be used when it surpasses the hourly charge.	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher	No Bid	Mileage rate applies outside of 100-mile radius	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	Dead head miles are \$2.00 per miles, and Live miles are \$3.50 per miles

Group D – Minimum 33 Seat Mini Bus

10.	Hourly Rate	per Hour	\$120.00	No Bid	\$110.00	\$95.00	No Bid	\$110.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$102.00	No Bid
	Minimum Hours per Trip:	Hours	4	No Bid	5	4	No Bid	7	No Bid	No Bid	5	No Bid
11.	Daily Rate – up to 24 hours	per Day	\$1,200.00	No Bid	\$1,320.00	\$1,140.00	No Bid	\$1,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$150 - \$2,448	No Bid
12.	Mileage Rate	per Mile	\$3.00	No Bid	\$3.75	n/a	No Bid	\$4.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.50	No Bid
Mileage Rate would apply when:			Mileage rate applies to trips that are 200 miles or over one-way but under 10 hours of total usage.	No Bid	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher		No Bid	Mileage rate applies outside of 100-mile radius	No Bid	No Bid	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	No Bid

**Charter Bus Services, 20-038V
Approved Provider List**

Contract: August 1, 2020 - July 31, 2021, with 4, 1-YR Renewals	AJL International 3049 E Highway 71 Del Valle, TX 78617	Clark Charters & Travel, Inc. 3406 W. 2nd Street Taylor, TX 76574	Corporate Services International (CSI) 4402 Nixon Lane Austin, TX 78725	Daisy Motor Coaches / Avalon Transportation, LLC 1505 E. Houston St. San Antonio, TX 78202	Kerrville Bus /Coach USA 1430 E. Houston St. San Antonio, TX 78204	OK Tours, LLC 737 Austin St. San Antonio, TX 78215	Regent Coach Line 515 Sherman San Antonio, TX 78202	Sam's Limousine and Transportation 13012 Moore Rd Austin, TX 78719	Star Shuttle 1343 Hallmark Dr. San Antonio, TX 78216	Wynne Transportation, LLC 7650 Esters Blvd Irving, TX 75063
--	--	--	--	---	---	---	--	---	---	--

Group E – Minimum 25 Seat Mini Bus

13.	Hourly Rate	per Hour	\$115.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$95.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$102.00	\$100.00
	Minimum Hours per Trip:	Hours	4	5	5	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5	4
14.	Daily Rate – up to 24 hours	per Day	\$1,150.00	\$1,350.00	\$1,320.00	\$1,140.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$150 - \$2,448	\$1,000.00
15.	Mileage Rate	per Mile	\$2.90	\$3.00	\$3.75	n/a	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.50	\$2 - 3.00
	Mileage Rate would apply when:		Mileage rate applies to trips that are 200 miles or over one-way but under 10 hours of total usage.	Mileage rate will be used when it surpasses the hourly charge.	The rate will be based on either the hourly rate or mileage, whichever is higher		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	If mileage rate is greater than the hourly charge.	Dead head miles are \$2.00 per miles, and Live miles are \$3.00 per miles

Group F – Additional Fees

16.	Additional Driver Fee	per Each	\$350.00	\$350.00	\$350.00	\$250.00	\$450.00	\$325.00	\$400.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$450.00
	Second Driver Fee would apply when:		Additional driver fee is only applicable once the First driver reaches 10 physical hours of driving during a trip but is still within 15 hours of the drivers work shift. Downtime doesn't count as physical driving. Additional driver fee will also apply if the first driver reaches 15 hours on the trip without 8 consecutive hours off-duty.	According to DOT specifications and compliance a driver change is necessary should the hours or mileage the driver is required to service exceeds that of safe operating standard. By default, Clark Travel will preposition drivers according to the route provided or agreed by the requesting party, and Clark Travel. Unless otherwise requested, Clark Travel does not perform "on-board" driver changes.		Any time a trip exceeds the drivers federal mandated "Hours of Service" rules. A driver cannot driver more than 1 Ohrs or be on duty more than 15hrs before he/she must show off-duty for a minimum of 8hrs.	When charter service exceeds 500 miles or more than 10 hrs of driving within one scheduled period and/or a total of 15 hours on duty.	When charter service exceeds 500 miles or more than 10 hrs of driving within one scheduled period and/or a total of 15 hours on duty.	If driver is needed more than 15 hours or travel more than 600 miles in one day.	first driver may not exceed 10 hours of continuous driving	If driving time exceeds 10 hrs or more and if total amount of time is more than 15 hours.	Driver change falls under the DOT laws of logs of service. The driver can not driver more than 10 hours and on duty 15.
17.	Overnight Rate – any trip over 24 hours	Total	\$200.00	# of days x day rate of vehicle	\$0.00	n/a	\$2,912.00	\$825.00	daily rate + hotel & parking	\$2,525.00		
18.	Cancellation Fee – less than 24 hours	Total	full cost of trip	\$500.00	\$150.00	\$500.00	\$450.00	100% of full payment	100% of full payment	\$300.00	full amount	
19.	Fuel Surcharge, if applicable	Rate	included	n/a	\$0.00	\$0.00	10% of Total	n/a	N/A	N/A	13%	

Exceptions:

			None	None	None	Will work with District regarding cancellations due to weather, tournament or playoff results	Overnight Fee: Overnight fee does not include driver relief feesn	None	Overnight: District would be responsible for driver's hotel room.	Overnight: District would be responsible for driver's hotel room.		
--	--	--	------	------	------	---	---	-------------	--	--	--	--

NOTE: Listed rates are the Maximum amount each Contractor is allowed to charge; however when requesting individual trip quotes, Contractors may offer pricing below their Maximum Rate on a trip by trip basis.